Patrick Heath Public Library Construction/Renovation of Young Adult Space

Steelcase/
Kl Palmieri Peter Pepper SitOnlt Turnstone
VENDOR GROUP 1 GROUP 2 GROUP 3 GROUP 4 GROUP 5 TOTAL
Texas Wilson $11,022.60 S5,796.26 $2,048.11 NO BID $4,238.32 $23,105.29
Lakeshore Learning Materials $189.00 $2,155.00 $837.00 NO BID $2,503.00 | $5,684.00
Rhodes Office Furniture 14,569,95 NO BID $2,377.21 $4,715.71 NO BID $7,092.92
Core Office Interiors $11,684.58 $6,320.66 $1,911.76 $2,984.20 NO BID $22,901.20




items bid not as specified




