
Project: Road Materials FY2025

Bid Opening Date: May 6, 2025

Time: 2pm

TxDOT 

Item
Description Units

Base Price 

($/unit)

Delivered Price 

($/unit)

Bid Bond 

Included

(Y/N)

Qualifications 

Included

(Y/N)

316 Crushed Igneous Trap Rock Aggregate, SAC-A, GR-4 Tons  $                  50.00  $                  76.91 

316 Crushed Igneous Trap Rock Aggregate, SAC-A, GR-5 Tons  $                  50.00  $                  76.91 

316 Crushed Igneous Trap Rock Aggregate, SAC-A, GR-DS Tons  No Bid  No Bid 

316 Asphalt Emulsion, (CHFRS-2P) Gallons  No Bid  No Bid 

330 LRA Pavement, Ty-1, Grade D Plus Tons  $                  82.50  $                109.41 

330 LRA Pavement, Ty-1, Grade AA Plus Tons  $                  80.00  $                106.91 

316 Crushed Igneous Trap Rock Aggregate, SAC-A, GR-4 Tons  $                  62.00  $                  87.70 

316 Crushed Igneous Trap Rock Aggregate, SAC-A, GR-5 Tons  $                  61.00  $                  86.70 

316 Crushed Igneous Trap Rock Aggregate, SAC-A, GR-DS Tons  $                  51.00  $                  76.70 

316 Asphalt Emulsion, (CHFRS-2P) Gallons  No Bid  No Bid 

330 LRA Pavement, Ty-1, Grade D Plus Tons  $                  82.50  $                109.98 

330 LRA Pavement, Ty-1, Grade AA Plus Tons  $                  79.50  $                106.98 

316 Crushed Igneous Trap Rock Aggregate, SAC-A, GR-4 Tons  No Bid  No Bid 

316 Crushed Igneous Trap Rock Aggregate, SAC-A, GR-5 Tons  No Bid  No Bid 

316 Crushed Igneous Trap Rock Aggregate, SAC-A, GR-DS Tons  No Bid  No Bid 

316 Asphalt Emulsion, (CHFRS-2P) Gallons  $                    2.85  $                    3.05 

330 LRA Pavement, Ty-1, Grade D Plus Tons  No Bid  No Bid 

330 LRA Pavement, Ty-1, Grade AA Plus Tons  No Bid  No Bid 

*lowest responsible bid will need to submit 1295 form, non-collusion document, and conflict of interest questionnaire

Martin Marietta Materials, Inc. Y Y

BID OPENING RESULTS

Company Name

Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC Y Y

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc. Y Y


